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Chairperson,
Your Excellencies, Distinguished Delegates, Ladies and Gentlemen,

I thank you Madam Chairperson for giving me the opportunity to address this distinguished
gathering. My delegation reaffirms our confidence in your able leadership and wishes to pledge
its support to you througÿ:ourdeliberations to a successful conclusion of this Session.

My delegation associates itself with the statements delivered by Fiji on behalf of the Group of 77
and China and Chad on behalf of the African Group.

Chairperson,
The theme for this year's session is very important. The Government of Kenya recognizes
violence against women and girls as one of the most pervasive human rights violations the world
over. It occurs in various forms such as rape, defilement, commercial child sexual exploitation,
domestic violence, sexual harassment as well as harmful cultural practices like female genital
mutilation, widow inheritance, and early marriage.





patriarchal nature of Kenyan society, culture and harmful traditional practices, Illiteracy, poverty
and limited resources for Government and non-state actors.

To overcome these challenges, the Government recognizes the need for strong political
commitment to end SGBV, implementation of the relevant laws and policies, provision of
comprehensive services for victims and survivors with assurance of personal security,
comprehensive and syStÿ:ÿdata collection to better inform policy and programming and
building of strong coalitions and partnerships.

Chairperson,
This is the reason my delegation believes that this year's theme is very important. CSW must
continue to be the platform through which the international community galvanizes global support
for gender equality and empowerment of women. We cannot afford to fail to adopt Agreed
Conclusions again, particularly on an important subject as eliminating violence against women.
Kenya is playing its rightful role in all fora of supporting efforts by contributing to the
achievement of acceptable and progressive Agreed Conclusions consistent with our Constitution,
the aspirations of Kenyan women and girls and the international tenets that we have agreed to
abide by. It is in this regard that my delegation urges for flexibility by all delegations in the
negotiations to ensure a speedy conclusion of the Agreed Conclusions. We should not allow the
challenges of the last session to befall on us again.

Chairperson,
Kenya has just successfully completed General Elections.  The elections were peaceful and
devoid of violence. There are many gains made. One of the most significant is the highest
number of women elected to both Parliament and the Senate. These gains, anchored in the
Constitution, will be consolidated and increased in future for the benefit of women and society in
general.

In conclusion, Madam Chairperson, I would like to re-affirm the commitment of the
Government of Kenya to accelerate efforts towards the elimination of all forms of violence
against women and girls.

Thank you Madam Chairperson.




