


  

 

 
 

�x The improvements in life expectancy have gone hand in hand with a shift in the causes of 
death from infectious and parasitic diseases to non-communicable, chronic diseases. 

 
�x In 2004, non-communicable diseases already accounted for 60 per cent of the deaths 

occurring worldwide and if the MDGs are achieved as planned, the reduction of the number 
of deaths due to communicable diseases and maternal conditions will produce an even 
greater shift of the burden of disease toward non-communicable diseases in the future. 

 
�x Among non-communicable diseases, cardiovascular diseases, cancer and respiratory 

illneses exact major death tolls in most regions. 
 

�x Because many non-communicable diseases are chronic, their treatment and management 
requires a comprehensive and coordinated response by the health system. Therefore a 
comprehensive primary-health care approach should guide the strengthening of health 
systems in order to meet the increasing demand for health services. 

 
Mr. Chairman, 
 
Not all regions have shared equally in the major advances just described. Africa and the group of 
low-income countries lag behind the rest of the world in reducing mortality and eliminating 
communicable, parasitic and maternal conditions as major causes of illness and death. 
 
In Africa, 64 per cent of all deaths are still caused by communicable diseases or maternal 
conditions and 38 per cent of all deaths occur among children under five, whereas in developed 
countries scarcely one per cent of all deaths occur before age five. 
 
Most children dying in low-income countries lose their lives because of preventable causes.  
Poverty and malnutrition are closely intertwined with the vulnerability of children to infectious 
disease. 
 



  

 

 
 

Mothers, particularly those in low-income countries, are still bearing an undue burden of 
morbidity and mortality for lack of appropriate healthcare both during the prenatal period and, 
crucially, at delivery. Advances made in training and deploying birth attendants are still falling 
short of the mark and in too many countries, women wishing to delay their next pregnancy or 
stop having children altogether still lack access to the means to do so.  In those countries, 
strengthening the family planning component of reproductive health programmes must be given 
a similar priority to the training of birth attendants and increased access to emergency obstetric 
care. 
  
 
Mr. Chairman,  
 
Clearly, achieving the health-related MDGs is essential to improve the health of people in low-
income countries and in a few middle-income countries. But for the rest of the world, the major 
health challenges lie elsewhere. Success in controlling the communicable causes of death 
increases survival and lets most people reach advanced ages, but does not necessarily reduce the 
burden of disease. To do so, the onset of chronic, non-communicable conditions must be 
postponed. 
 
The report underscores the importance of reducing the prevalence of the risk factors associated 
with the most common chronic non-communicable diseases. Reducing tobacco use, promoting 
healthy diets and physical activity to prevent overweight and obesity, and preventing the 
excessive use of alcohol all contribute to produce longer and healthier lives. 
 
Cost effective measures to achieve those outcomes exist and involve action in sectors other than 
health. Better health education must be imparted in schools, to children and young people, in 
ways appropriate to their level of maturity. Agricultural policy and the regulation of food 
products are means to ensure that healthy products are available at reasonable prices for the 
benefit of all. Other effective measures involve regulating trade, using taxation judiciously and 
improving urban planning to produce environments that are safe and promote physical activity. 
 
There are also effective measures to reduce the number of traffic accidents and injuries that take 
a major toll in many countries, particularly middle-income countries. Those measures include 
imposing strict speed limits, enforcing the use of seatbelts and combating the use of alcohol. 
 
It is also crucial to strengthen health systems to ensure that they are able to deliver the services 
that communities require, including not only curative care and the treatment of acute conditions, 
but also preventive care, health promotion and the long-term management of chronic conditions. 
 
Increasing the supply of health workers is necessary for the strengthening of health systems. 
Shortages of health workers are severe in many low-income countries but they also exist in 
middle-income and high-income countries where the burden of chronic disease is increasing as 
the population ages. Concerted efforts at both the national and the international levels are needed 
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in order to train health workers, ensuring that training produces the variety of skills required and 
that it is oriented to the contexts in which health workers are needed.  
 
Lastly, Mr. Chairman, 
 
The report underscores the need to promote equity of health outcomes. To do so, it is essential to 
provide all people access to primary health through financing methods based on risk-sharing. 
 
Recently, the “health economy” has been growing faster than GDP at the world level. Because 
investing in health is investing in human capital, that disparity in growth may not in itself be a 
cause of concern unless it continues to deliver grossly inequitable outcomes both within and 
among countries. 
 
The positive association between increasing socio-economic status and better health has been 
remarkably persistent. Health disparities are stronger in countries with high levels of inequality. 
To improve health outcomes, therefore, efforts to reduce social disparities, through education, 
improvements in working conditions, and targeted welfare, also need to be pursued.  
 
In sum, it is better to prevent than to treat and it is best if both are supported by societies that are 
committed to equitable outcomes for all. 
  
Thank you, Mr. Chairman. 
 


